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Showgard®

Mount Gauge
207

198

181

171
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What Showgard mount size
for this stamp? 1. Place stamp
on  the perforation line. 2. Use the
lowest nmber that is visible.What
is the size of this Showgard
mount strip? 1. Place strip on
the 5mm line. 2. The size is the
lowest number that is uncovered.
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ECONOMY TIP:
Showgard mount strips go a long
way if unused portions are filed
for quick and convenient
retrieval. Original packages of
Showgard mounts are ideal for
this purpose when  opened in the
recommended way - first cut off
the top of the package with scis-
sors. Then cut away the left side.
This converts the package to a
convenient sleeve for holding
partly used strip as well as
unused contents of the package.


